



Bid Opening Date: 03/20/09

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B442009025179000

Vendor	Unit Price									
N Business Graphics	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	624.00	500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
Jayden Graphics, Inc.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	497.36	605.61	31.28	58.35	26.88	90.38	144.86	202.12	28.40	26.82
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	25.73	24.89	91.23	45.45	209.44	117.87	45.45			
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
Unisource	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	554.50	803.60	27.60	174.49	27.60	133.70	542.50	186.00	27.30	27.30
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	39.35	28.00	102.00	319.50	190.00	87.00	124.00			
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
Gage Van Horn & Associates, Inc.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	No Bid									
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40

* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).



Bid Opening Date: 03/20/09

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B442009025179000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Love Envelopes, Inc.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	547.60	601.80	15.21	67.73	18.15	61.67	207.08	No Bid	16.71	14.79
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	18.84	17.04	73.18	63.16/64.38	369.43	74.51	16.61/18.02			
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
R. R. Donnelley	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	729.26	917.19	26.75	116.38	29.82	148.84	1,931.63	122.10	27.69	26.04
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	32.05	30.80	122.73	574.95	185.05	39.67	171.21			
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	No Bid									
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40

* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).