



Bid Opening Date: 08/28/09

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B172009040852000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Johnson Bros Oil Co.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	2.3754	2.0528	2.3304	2.0428	2.3554	2.0528	2.3554	2.0578	2.3254	2.0378
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	2.3954	2.0978	2.3304	2.0528	2.3854	2.1078	2.3754	2.0778	2.3354	2.0378
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	2.0478									
Brenco Marketing Corp.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	2.4004	2.1278	2.4004	2.1278	2.4004	2.1278	2.4004	2.1279	2.4004	2.1278
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	2.4004	2.1278	2.4004	2.1278	2.4004	2.1278	2.4004	2.1278	2.4004	2.1278
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	2.1278									
Petroleum Traders Corporation	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	No bid	2.1315	2.4092	2.1026	2.4158	2.0777	No bid	2.2330	2.4247	2.1083
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	2.4769	2.1880	No bid	2.1722	No bid	2.0941
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	2.1100									
Gold Star Petroleum Inc.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	2.4132	2.1348	2.3635	2.0853	2.3174	2.0390	2.4216	2.1432	2.3760	2.0976
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	2.4602	2.2051	2.3859	2.1075	2.3919	2.1135	2.3980	2.1196	2.3737	2.0953
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	2.0944									

* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).



Bid Opening Date: 08/28/09

Bid Recording Report for Solicitation # B172009040852000

Vendor	Unit Price									
Mansfield Oil Co.	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	2.3604	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	2.4137	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828	2.3604	2.0828
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
	2.0828									
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	
	Line 1	Line 2	Line 3	Line 4	Line 5	Line 6	Line 7	Line 8	Line 9	Line 10
	Line 11	Line 12	Line 13	Line 14	Line 15	Line 16	Line 17	Line 18	Line 19	Line 20
	Line 21	Line 22	Line 23	Line 24	Line 25	Line 26	Line 27	Line 28	Line 29	Line 30
Line 31	Line 32	Line 33	Line 34	Line 35	Line 36	Line 37	Line 38	Line 39	Line 40	

* To create a new page, select all (CTRL+A), copy the content (CTRL+C), go to the end of the document (CTRL+End) and insert the copied content (CTRL+V).